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GAVI DOCG 

PISÉ 2019 

 

GAVI DOCG 

RISERVA 2020 

 

GAVI DOCG 

2022 

 

 
 

 

PIEMONTE DOC 

BARBERA 
LARGÉ 2021 

 

PIEMONTE DOC 

BARBERA 
2022 

 

 

92/100 
Subtle aromas of citrus fruit, grapefruit 
peel, white flowers and raw almonds. 
Medium-bodied, juicy and fresh with 
chalky texture and bright minerality at 
the end. From biodynamically grown 
grapes with Demeter certification. Drink 
now. 

92/100 
Attractive aromas of fresh lime, pear 
skins, tarragon, jasmine and crushed 
stones. Medium-bodied, delicate and 
sleek on the palate with vivid acidity and 
a refreshing, citrusy finish. From 
biodynamically grown grapes with 
Demeter certification. Drink now. 

92/100 
Sliced apples, ripe lemons, savory herbs 
and citrus blossom on the nose. 
Medium-bodied, round-textured and 
polished on the palate with bright, 
refreshing fruit character. Flavorful 
finish. From biodynamically grown 
grapes with Demeter certification. 

  

  
 

  

 

  

  

 

  
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

  

 

 

 
 

 
 
 

Brilliant straw yellow. Persuasive nose, 

warm, refined nuances of flowers 

of orange blossom and lemon, with hints 

woodland, moss and fern, then 

flow into a stormy sea. 

The taste is dominated by sapidity 

saltiness, with fresh returns of lime and 

mint, to then relaunch a minerality 

almost tuffaceous.  

 

 
 
 

Light straw yellow. The bouquet is 

distinguished by floral notes from 

elderberry to hawthorn flowers, 

Mediterranean herbs, thyme and sage 

with an iodized finish. Lively freshness 

supported by abundant sapidity. Fine 

wine. 

 

 
 

Transparent purple. Marked notes of red 

fruits, wild blueberries, blackberries and 

currants alternate with balsamic with 

hints of liquorice. Energetic freshness 

and copious tannic texture, outline a rich 

dense taste with a savory and citrusy 

finish. 

 

 92/100 
 

A combination of ripe peach, preserved 
lemon and fresh herbs emanate from 
the glass. A creamy texture rewards the 
palate, while flavours of white 
nectarine and toasted almonds are 
underlined by a lingering, elegant 
acidity. 

92/100 
 

Luxuriously waxy and honeyed, this 

Gavi offers a toasty richness that fills the 

mouth. Perfectly ripe peaches emerge 

towards the end, highlighting the wine's 

exceptional fruit character. Notes of 

baked nectarine and toasted almonds 

delight the palate, leading to a salty 

finish of great finesse and lingering 

acidity 

persistent acidity. 

 

91/100 
 

Aromas of white flowers and green 
apple combine on the nose, while 
subtle notes of crushed stone sneakily 
capture the attention. The palate is 
delighted by hints of Meyer lemon and 
a firm minerality that emphasises Gavi's 
limestone-rich soils, culminating in a 
finish that is both clean and lasting. 

 86/100 
 

The wine immediately stains the glass 
an inky purple, while heady aromas of 
cooked black plum, vanilla, violets and 
aniseed emerge from the glass. The 
palate shifts gears with sour plum 
flavours complemented by dried 
rosemary, sage and thyme, while earthy 
notes and fine tannins complete the 
wine. 
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PIEMONTE 
PINOT 
2021 

 

PIEMONTE 
PASSITO 2021 
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